Dear
Thank you for your Freedom of Information request concerning staff sent home due to
being intoxicated.
The Trust can provide the following information:

1. How many staff have been sent home because they were deemed unfit for work due to
intoxication in the last three years?
This is not recorded formally by workforce unless they become a formal
conduct/capability issue. However, these issues are dealt with locally but would take
more than 18 hours to collate this information as not recorded in the format being
requested therefore exempt under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
2. In 2012-13? See above
3. How many staff have been dismissed for turning up to work intoxicated in the last
three years? 0
4. In 2012-13? 0
If you have any queries about this response please contact the information governance
manager at foi@homerton.nhs.uk , in the first instance. If, following that, you still have
any concerns, you may contact the Information Commissioner either by letter, FOI/EIR
Complaints resolution, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SM9 5AF, or by
email www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk to take them further.
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